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CHOSEN BY…  
MIKE COPE
The early part of this 
route follows the 

North Downs Way eastwards 
through beech woodland, 
before striking north along the 
dip slope of the downs and 
across large tracts of pasture 
land. In the latter half, there 
are spectacular views of the 
London skyline, the Shard and 
the Wembley Arch on a clear 
day (so be sure to pack your 
binoculars). Come spring, wild 
flowers line the verges of the 
ascending byway: nodding 
violets, celandines, cowslips, 
bluebells and wood anemones. 

1 Start  
Locate entrance to car park 

and keep ahead across road 

into woodland. When you 
reach another road (near large 
concrete basin), go R then 
immediately L along North 
Downs Way (NDW). Keep 
ahead as another track merges 
from R. Track bends sharp L 
past farmyard and stables into 
woodland. At next 4-way 
junction with metal barriers 
(and large concrete water 
tank), keep ahead along NDW. 
Maintain direction descending 
track, ignoring all turnoffs to 
reach another circular concrete 
water tank.

2 1½ mile/2.6km 
Go L immediately after 

water tank on descending track 
that leads to Honeysuckle 
Bottom sawmill. Go carefully 
through sawmill until you come 

CHOSEN BY…  
PHILIP THOMAS
The River Thames 
squeezes between 

the chalk folds of the Berkshire 
Downs and Chiltern Hills at 
Goring, where in the last 
half-million years it has 
scooped out the woody valley 
known today as the Goring 
Gap. The opening miles of this 
walk meander across its wavy  
west side to cross the river at 
Streatley and turn downstream 
from Goring to Whitchurch on 
the Thames Path National Trail.  
You’ll largely be following the 
route tramped by hundreds of 
eager young walkers on March 
25th 1932, all of whom had 
arrived at Pangbourne aboard 
the ‘Hiker’s Mystery Express’ 
from London Paddington.

1 Start  
Leave station from 

London-bound platform (2) 
and head down to main road 
(A329). Cross and turn L along 
pavement for ½ mile. Take 
footpath R along riverbank. 
Follow this towpath, past Beale 
Wildlife Park, for another 1¾ 
miles. Reaching field with 
church peeping through 
trees on L, turn L at private 
mooring to a metal gate/sign 
in the far hedgerow. Follow 
paddock edge to track and go 
L to lane. Turn R along lane to 
main road in Lower Basildon.

2 3 miles/4.6km 
Turn R along pavement for 

nearly ½ mile, crossing road 
where the pavement switches 
sides. At junction, turn L into ➥ ➥

to wooden fingerpost. Bear L 
up very steep stony path into 
woodland. When gradient 
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ROUTE
Start/parking West 
Hanger car park, grid ref 
TQ069494, postcode 
GU5 9TE 
Is it for me? Relatively flat 
along the North Downs 
Way with one steep climb 
(after sawmill). Thereafter 
it undulates across fields, 
pasture land and byway
Stiles None

PLANNING
Nearest town Guildford
Refreshments None on 
route, but in Shere village 
1 mile from start 
Public toilets As above
Public transport None to 
start. Bus 32 (Guildford to 
Dorking) stops in Shere; 
bus 478 (Guildford to 
Leatherhead) also stops in 
East Clandon/West Horsley 
Maps OS Explorer 145; 
Landranger 186

PLAN YOUR WALK

ROUTE
Start/parking Pangbourne 
Station, grid ref SU632766, 
postcode RG8 7DY. £4.20 
weekends/after 10am 
Mon-Fri. Or Pangbourne 
Village Hall (£5.50) 
Is it for me? Muddy 
riverside paths, undulating 
woodland tracks and open 
downland. Return leg on 
waymarked Thames Path
Stiles None

PLANNING
Nearest town Reading
Refreshments Choice of 
pubs in villages on route, 
plus Beale Wildlife Park 
café. Try Goring’s John 
Barleycorn (01491 872509) 
Public toilets Pangbourne 
(village hall), Goring 
(Wheel Orchard car park)
Public transport Trains 
from London Paddington/
Didcot Parkway (gwr.com). 
Bus 143 from Reading 
(thames-travel.co.uk) 
Maps OS Explorer 137; 
Landranger 189

PLAN YOUR WALKEmerging onto the sloping chalk 
grassland of Lardon Chase. 

Distance: 8 miles/12.8km Time: 4 hours Grade: Moderate Distance: 11¾ miles/19km Time: 5½ hours Grade: Moderate

Huge beech trees and conifers line 
the route of the North Downs Way.
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Hook End Lane, signposted for 
Upper Basildon. At fork, go R 
for Aldworth. In another mile, 
just before junction, swing R up 
drive for Ash Hill (bridleway). 
Where the drive hairpins L, 
carry straight on down track 
(here you cross segment of 
Grim’s Ditch, thought to mark 
an Iron Age tribal boundary).
Before main road, swing L 
through kissing gate into  
National Trust land ‘The Holies’. 

3 5 miles/7.9km 
Follow grassy track ahead 

curving up into the combe. 
At gate, either carry on, or for 
a great view, turn R up track 
which zags up to a bench. Go L 
through gate, and along wood 
edge to rejoin main track 
through gate at head of the 
combe. At next gate/junction, 
you may wish to detour R  
150m down to a viewpoint. 
Otherwise keep to the stony 
track ahead. This eventually 
dips to a gate/junction. Carry 
straight on up to road.

4 6¼ miles/10km  
Cross R into car park and 

go through gate at back into 
NT Lardon Chase. Keep to 
the crest of the hill until you 
come to a gate, shortly before 
a bench (with a trig point 
concealed in the hedgerow 
nearby). Tuck through gate 
for a superb view north from 
Lough Down and return to the 
bench. Turn R downhill to a 
gate in the bottom corner of 
Lardon Chase. Follow track 

ahead to cross road. Turn L and 
carefully negotiate Streatley 
crossroads, straight on down 
to Goring and Streatley’s two 
-part, timber-beamed bridge. 

5 7½ miles/11.9km 
Crossing the Thames into 

Goring, swing R across road 
and down steps. Here, either 
carry on through churchyard to 
John Barleycorn pub and turn 
R down Ferry Lane further on, 
or take the signposted Thames 
Path R down to the riverbank 
and follow it downstream.

6 9 miles/14.4km 
1½ miles further on at Ferry 

Cottage, the trail turns L away 
from the riverbank, then R at 
a T-junction onto a bridleway 
into Lower Hartslock Wood 
(it’s worth detouring up the 

first path L for a magnificent 
view back to the Goring Gap). 
Eventually the trail pulls away 
from the river, dips into a dry 
valley, then rises steeply to 
a paved drive, which leads to 
Whitchurch. Take care as you 
turn R down road to pick up 
pavement. In abt 500m, the 
Thames Path tucks R into 
a drive for Walliscote House, 
then through churchyard to the 
riverbank. Cross Whitchurch 
Bridge and take footpath R, 
signed ‘station’.  

levels out, follow narrow path 
round to R and locate metal 
fence. Keep fence on L and 
follow path downhill to road. 
Go straight across and continue 
on path that climbs again uphill 
and broadens into wide track.

3 3¼ mile/5.1km 
At next junction go L then 

diagonally L through gate to 
follow narrow fenced path 
with horse paddocks on L. 
Go through another gate 
and maintain direction. 
Cross driveway and go R at 
T-junction which leads to tarred 
lane. Bear L along lane which 
climbs gradually uphill. At 
wooden fingerpost, go R up 
concrete driveway (towards 
Hillside Farm). Zig-zag R and L 
around farm and continue on 
bridleway. When you reach 
gate, follow path as it bends L 
then merges with tarred lane. 
Continue downhill and bear R 
when you reach houses.

4 4¼ mile/6.8km 
At next junction, go R up 

tarred byway (towards Fullers 
Farm). Follow lane as it climbs 
to brow of hill then descends. 
At sharp L-hand bend, go R 
along public byway. In due 
course byway bears sharp L 
along concrete drive (near 
Hook Wood Pastures). There 
are views ahead of Woking’s 
tower blocks. Follow byway as 
it descends gradually. Further 
down hill, look R for views of 
the Shard on London’s skyline. 
Keep descending to reach 

junction (Blakes Lane). Go L 
along lane past Woolgars Farm. 

5 5¾ mile/9.4km 
Take next L up public 

byway around two sharp bends 
before climbing steadily uphill. 
Lane becomes uneven with 
flints and tree roots. If you 
come in early spring you will 
see dog’s mercury under beech 
trees. Further up lane look L 
to see London skyline and 
Wembley Arch. Just before you 
reach house there is a wood on 
L carpeted with bluebells in 
early May. Follow byway as it 
zig-zags L then R to reach 
junction you passed earlier. 
Retrace steps up to brow of hill 
and down again. At bottom, go 
R along narrow fenced path, 

avoiding all turnoffs. Path soon 
becomes pitted and uneven 
with stones and tree roots. 
Keep following sinuous path, 
lined with hawthorn blossom 
and celandines in spring.

6 7½ mile/12.1km 
When you reach a road, 

bear R along it for 500m. 
At L-hand bend, bear R into 
woodland along NDW and 
retrace steps to car park.  
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